MINUTES OF MEETING HELD JUNE 28§, 2007

The Common Council of the City of Somerset, Kentucky met in regular session on
Monday, June 25, 2007 at 7:00 p.m. with the following present: Mayor Eddie Girdler.
Council Members: Charlie New, John Minton, Jim Mitchell, Pat Bourne, Jerry Burnett,
Tim Rutherford, Jim Rutherford, Linda Stringer, James Eastham and Jerry Girdler. City
Clerk David Godsey and City Attorney Carrie Weise. Absent: Council Members Donna
Hunley and Steve Kelley.

Mr. New moved to approve the minutes of the last regular meeting held on June 11, 2007
along with the reports to be approved as delivered. Mr. Girdler seconded the motion.
Upon roll call the following Council Members voted “Aye”: Mr. New, Mr. Minton, Mr.
Mitchell, Mr. Bourne, Mr. Burnett, Mr. T. Rutherford, Mr. J. Rutherford, Ms. Stringer,
Mr. Eastham and Mr. Girdler.

Mr. Mitchell moved to reduce the City Attorney’s annual salary to $55,000 from $65,000
with a six month review. Mr. Bourne seconded the motion. Upon roll call the following
Council Members voted “Aye”: Mr. Minton, Mr. Mitchell, Mr. Bourne, Mr. Burnett, Mr.
T. Rutherford, Mr. J. Rutherford, Ms. Stringer and Mr. Eastham. Voting “Nay”: Mr. New
and Mr. Girdler. Motion passed.

Second reading was given the following Ordinance:

ORDINANCE NO. 071-04

AN ORDINANCE TO THE CITY OF SOMERSET, KENTUCKY, ADOPTING A
PERSONNEL PAY AND CLASSIFICATION PLAN PURSUANT TO KRS 83A.070
REQUIRING THAT SUCH A PLAN BE ADOPTED,

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COMMON COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SOMERSET,
KENTUCKY:

(A) The purpose of this section is to comply with the requirements of KRS 83A.070(4),
providing that each city shall fix the ion of city empl. in d: with
a personnel und pay classilication plan which plan shall be adopted by ordinance.

(B) There is hereby adopted a Pay and Classification Plan attached hereto as Exhibit
“A”, and made part hereof, and incorporated in full, said plan hereby establishing
authorized positions of employment with the city each pasition having a corresponding
range of compensation s set forth in said docurnent.

(C) If any of this Ordinance is deemed by a court uf competent Jjurisdiction to be
ble or itutiona!, the ining provisi of this Ord shall
continue in full force and effect,

(D) Any Ordinance in conflict with this Ordinance or any policies in conflict with the
ones enacted herein are hereby repealed in so far as the same are in conflict herewith.

(E) This ordinance shall be in full force and effect upon passage, approval, and
publication according to law.

FIRST READING, é L‘ wb. [/ ; Qm 7 -

SECOND READING

Approved:
e [}

Mayor, Eddie Girdler
ATTEST:

City Clerk, David Godsey




CLASSIFICATION AND PAY SCHEDULE
CITY OF SOMERSET
FOR PERIOD ENDING JUNE 30, 2008

TITI E/CLASSIFICATION " MINIMUM ave
CITY CLERK 1 40000 19.23 saoon 24.03
ASST CITY CLRKS 2 18200 875 24000 1353
BUDGET DIRECTOR 1 3s000 1682 as000 2163
CITY ATTORNEY 1 55000 26.44 65000 3125
CITY ENGINEER 1 55000 25.44 65000 3128
4R DIRECTOA 1 28000 13.45 3s000 16.82
PURCHASING AGENT 1 30000 14.42 38000 18.26
ACCOUTING/CLERKS 3 15080 7.25 24000 11.53
OFFICE MANAGER/SEC 1 22880 1 26000 125
INTERNAL AUDITOR/SAFETY CODRD 1 35000 16.82 40000 19.23
PLANNER/COMP PLAN 1 35000 16.82 40000 19.23
FAC MANAGER/CODE ENFORCEMENT 1 15000 16.82 40000 19.23
BUILDING (NSPECTOR 1 35000 16.82 40000 15.23
PLANNING ASST/GRANTS 2 16540 s 24000 1153
cLERk 1 15080 735 24000 1183
GAS DEPT MANAGER 1 45000 2163 55000 26.4a
OPERATING MANAGER 1 20000 14.42 35000 1682
TRANS LINE MANAGER/FOREMEN a 25000 12.02 30000 19.42
OPERATORS/SPECIALIST 6 20000 9.61 30000 14.42
CUSTOMEN SERVICE TECHS 4 18200 8.75 30000 14.42
CORROSION TECHNICIAN 1 30000 14.42 35000 16.82
METER READERS/GENERAL 3 15080 7.25 24000 1153
WATER/SEWER MANAGER 1 40000 19.23 50000 24.03
WATER/SEWER OPERATORS 15 22500 1081 35000 1682
FOREMEN a 24000 11.53 22500 15.62
i MGA OF DPERATIONS/SUPERINTENDENTS 3 25000 1z.01 35000 16.82
CLERK. 2 18200 75 28500 13.7
i CROSS CONNEGTION SPECIAUST 1 25000 iz 32500 15.62
3 EQUIFMENT OPERATORS s 25000 11.01 27500 13.22
i METER READERS a 16640 8 24000 1153
MANAGER OF OPERATIONS 1 25000 12.01 35000 16.82
ASST MANAGER OF OPERATIONS 1 24000 1153 32500 15.62
PRETREATMENT CLERK 1 18200 8.75 30000 1442
UET STATION TECHNICIANS 2 20240 9.73 30000 14.42
GENERAL WORKERS 4 16640 a 24000 11.53
COLLECTIONS CLERKS s 18200 8.75 30000 1442
UTILITY SERVICE SUPERVISOR 1 22500 10.81 27500 1322
PARKS AND REC DIRECTOR 1 40000 19.23 45000 2163
WATER PARK MANAGER 1 28000 18.26 42000 2019
MAINTENANCE SUPERVISOR 1 25000 12.01 30000 1442
DATA ENTRY/PROGRAM SPECIALIST 1 25000 12.01 30000 14.42
ACTIVITIES/MAINTENANCE [ 16120 1.75 25000 12.01
ACTIVITIES DIRECTOR 1 25000 12.01 30000 14.42
ACCOUNTING CLERK/PROGRAM ASST 1 18200 8.75 23500 11.29
STREET/SANITATION MANAGER 1 35000 16.82 a0wo 19.23
FOREMEN 2 25000 12.01 30000 14.42
SOLID WASTE HANDLERS 12 18200 875 32000 15.38
TRUCK DRIVER/CDL 3 22880 11 25000 12.01
PUBLIC SERVICE WORKERS 9 18200 8.75 25000 12.01
CLERK 1 18200 875 25000 12.01
MECHANICS 3 22800 10.96 30000 14.42
POLICE CHIEF 1 45000 2163 52500 25.24
ASST POLICE CHIEF 1 42500 20.43 47500 22.83
CAPTAIN 1 32500 1562 40000 19.23
UEUTENANTS B 30000 14.42 35000 16.82
SARGTS a 28500 13.7 32500 15.62
DOES NOT INCLUDE
DETECTIVES E] 30000 14.42 35000 16.82 STATE INCENTIVE PAY
POLICE OFFICERS 19 23000 1108 30000 14.42
POUCE RECRUITS a 21000
CLERKS. 2 18200 a7s 25000 12.01
PROPERTY OFFICER 1 18200 8.75 25000 12.01
FIRE/EMS CHIEF 1 35000 16.82 45000 2163 DOES NOT INCLUDE
FIRE/EMS ASST CHIEF 1 32500 15.62 42500 20.43 STATE INCENTIVE
MAIORS 5 30000 1442 37500 18.02
CAPTAINS B 28500 13.7 35000 16.82
LIEUTENANTS a 76500 12.74 32500 15.62
ASST CHIEF/PARAMEDIC 1 30000 14.42 38000 18.26
PARAMEDIC/FIREFIGHTER 22 26500 12.74 32500 15.62
EMT/FIREFIGHTER 26 22500 10.81 28500 13.7
TRAINING DIRECTOR 1 25000 1z2.01 32000 15.38
OFFICE/CLERICAL 3 22500 10.81 28500 13.2




Mr. New moved to approve the above ordinance on its second reading regarding adopting
a personnel pay and classification plan. Mr. Burnett seconded the motion. Upon roll call
the following Council Members voted “Aye”: Mr. New, Mr. Minton, Mr. Mitchell, Mr.
Bourne, Mr. Burnett, Mr. T. Rutherford, Mr. J. Rutherford, Ms. Stringer, Mr. Eastham
and Mr. Girdler.

Second reading was given of the following Ordinance:

ORDINANCE 07-05

AN ORDINANCE ADOPTING THE CITY OF SOMERSET, KENTUCKY ANNUAL
BUDGET FOR THE FISCAL YEAR BEGINNING JULY 1, 2007 AND ENDING
JUNE 30, 2008 ESTIMATING REVENUES AND RESOURCES AND
APPROPRIATING FUNDS OF THE CITY OF SOMERSET, KENTUCKY.

Mr. New moved to approve the above ordinance on its second reading regarding
approving the annual budget and approving a $1,100. raise for each full time employee.
Mr. Burnett seconded the motion. Upon roll call the following Council Members voted
“Aye”: Mr. New, Mr. Burnett, Mr. Eastham and Mr. Girdler. Voting “Nay”: Mr. Minton,
Mr. Mitchell, Mr. Bourne, Mr. T. Rutherford, Mr. J. Rutherford and Ms. Stringer. Motion

failed.

Mr. T. Rutherford made a motion to go into executive session to discuss personnel
litigation. Ms. Stringer seconded the motion. Upon roll call the following Council
Members voted “Aye”: Mr. New, Mr. Minton, Mr. Mitchell, Mr. Bourne, Mr. Burnett,
Mr. T. Rutherford, Mr. J. Rutherford, Ms. Stringer, Mr. Eastham and Mr. Girdler.

No action taken in executive session.

Second reading was given of the following Ordinance:

ORDINANCE NUMBER 07-05

AN ORDINANCE ADOPTING THE CITY OF SOMERSET, KENTUCKY ANNLIAL
BUDGET FOR THE FISCAL YEAR BEGINNING JULY 1, 2007 AND ENDINO JUNE 30,
2008 ESTIMATING REVENUES AND RESOURCES AND APPROPRIATING FUNDS OF
THE CITY OF SOMERSET, KENTUCKY.

WHEREAS, AN ANNUAL BUDGET PROPOSAL AND MESSAGE HAVE BEEN
PREPARED AND DELIVERED TO THE COMMON COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
SOMERSET, KENTUCKY; AND

WHEREAS, THE COMMON COUNCIL HAS RECEIVED THE PROPOSED BUDGET AND
MADE NECESSARY MODIFICATIONS.

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY OF SOMERSET, KENTUCKY:

SECTION 1. THAT THE ANNUAL BUDGEY FOR THE FISCAL YEAR
BEGINNING JULY 1, 2007 AND ENDING JUNE 30, 2008
1S HERERY ADOPTED AS FOLLOWS:

REVENUE EXPENDITURES

GENERAL FUND $11,438,734.00 $11,438,734.00

SANITATION SERVICE $2,425,000.00 $2,425,000.00

OAS SERVICE $19,762,200.00 $19,762,200.00

WATER SERVICE $6,641,000.00 $6,641,000.00

WASTEWATER $2,512,800.00 $2,512,800.00

WATER PARK $1,331,750.00 $1,331,750.00

PARKS AND REC $662,550.00 $662,550.00

EMS §$5,733,509.00 $5,733,909.00

TOTAL ALL FUNDS $50,507,943.00 $50,507,943.00

SECTION 2. THIS ORDINANCE SHALL TAKE EFFECT AFTER ITS
PASSAGE AND UPON PUBLICATION.

FIRST READING %}‘lﬁ £ {é A007

SECOND READING

wrprovin_ Ll p i%
EDWARD R. GIRDLER, MAYOR
CITY OF SOMERSET, KENTUCKY

ATTEST:
DAVID GODSEY, CITY CLERK.

Mr. New moved to approve the above ordinance on its second reading regarding the
annual budget for the 2007-2008 fiscal year and approving a $1,100. raise for each full
time employee. Mr. Girdler seconded the motion. Upon roll call the following Council
Members voted “Aye”: Mr. New, Mr. Burnett, Mr. T. Rutherford, Mr. J. Rutherford, Ms.
Stringer, Mr. Eastham and Mr. Girdler. Voting “Nay”: Mr. Minton, Mr. Mitchell and Mr.
Bourne. Motion passed.




First reading was given the following Ordinance:

ORDINANCE NO. 07-07

AN ORDINANCE TO THE CITY OF SOMERSET, KENTUCKY,
ADOPTING A CROSS-CONNECTION CONTROL PROGRAM FOR
THE PREVENTION OF CROSS-CONNECTION CONTAMINATION,

Mr. Mitchell moved to approve the above ordinance on its first reading regarding the
cross-connection control program. Mr. T. Rutherford seconded the motion. Upon roll call
the following Council Members voted “Aye”: Mr. New, Mr. Minton, Mr. Mitchell, Mr.

Bourne, Mr. Burnett, Mr. T. Rutherford, Mr. J. Rutherford, Ms. Stringer, Mr. Eastham
and Mr. Girdler.

Mr. T. Rutherford moved to accept a bid for a roll-off truck from Worldwide Equipment
in the amount of $116,960. Mr. J. Rutherford seconded the motion. Upon roll call the
following Council Members voted “Aye”: Mr. New, Mr. Minton, Mr. Mitchell, Mr.

Bourne, Mr. Burnett, Mr. T. Rutherford, Mr. J. Rutherford, Ms. Stringer, Mr. Eastham
and Mr. Girdler.

CITY OF SOMERSET WORLDWIDE EQUIPMENT, INC.
1800)

. by
INVITIATION TO BID JIM DOTBON, MUNICIPAL SPECIALIAT

SEALED BIDS FOR THE PURCHASE OF ONE CAB AND CHASSIS WITH
ROLL-OFF TIOIST FRAME WILL B¥ RECEIVED AT THE CiTY CLERK'S
OFFICE, 400 E. MT. VERNON STREET, SOMERSET, KY., JUNE 15, 2007
UNTIL 2:00 P.M. LOCAL TIME. AT THAT TIME THE BIDS WILL BE

JUNE 13,2007
OPENED AND READ.
CITY OF SOMERSEY
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400 E. MT. VERNON STREET, SOMERSET, KY., 42501, 606-679-6366.
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Mr. Girdler moved to accept the following bids from Ready Mix Concrete for the 2007-
2008 fiscal year in the amount of $69.50 for class A, and $68.00 for class B concrete. Mr.
Eastham seconded the motion. Upon roll call the following Council Members voted
“Aye”: Mr. New, Mr. Minton, Mr. Mitchell, Mr. Bourne, Mr. Burnett, Mr. T. Rutherford,
Mr. J. Rutherford, Ms. Stringer, Mr. Eastham and Mr. Girdler.

INVITATION TO BID

The City of Somerset will accept sealed bids for “Class A” and “Class B” concrete for the
fiscal year 2007-2008 in the City Clerk’s Office on or before June 15, 2007 by 3:00 p.m,
Bids may also be mailed to:

City of Somerset

P.O. Box 989

Somerset, Ky 42502

All material must meet Kentucky Transportation Department specifications
Bids will be opened on or about June 15, 2007 at 3:00 p.m. The City of Somerset
reserves the right to reject any and all bids.

Eddie R. Girdler, Mayor
City of Somerset

TUCKER REAQY MIX, INC.
W, SOMERSET, KY

CONCRETE

JUNE 14, 2007
Dute: June 12, 2087
Project Namo/Number: BID FOR 2007-2608
Location: CFTY OF SOMERSET
| Conerats Sreagth | Mix Code Price/Cu. V4.
CLASS A 602680 $65.50
CLAS B ]
2650 S48 CITY OF SOMERSET
400 E_MT. VERNON ST
SOMERSET, KY.
TFea MeVard [ NA J
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Mr. Eastham moved to accept the following bid from Hinkle for blacktop for the 2007-
2008 fiscal year. Mr. Girdler seconded the motion. Upon roll call the following Council
Members voted “Aye”: Mr. New, Mr. Minton, Mr. Mitchell, Mr. Bourne, Mr. Burnett,
Mr. T. Rutherford, Mr. J. Rutherford, Ms. Stringer, Mr. Eastham and Mr. Girdler.



INVITATION TO BID

The City of Somerset will accept sealed bids for Blacktop and Coldmix for the fiscal year
2007-2008 in the City Clerk’s office on or before June 15, 2007 by 3:00 p.m. Bids may
also be mailed to:

City of Somerset

P.0O. Box 989

Somerset, Ky 42502

Blacktop and Coldmix should be bid per ton, picked up and per ton applied. Resurfaced
roads are to be tacked by contractor.

All material must meet Kentucky Transportation specifications. Materials must be
applied within 15 days of approval by council.

Bids will be opened on or about June 15, 2007 at 3:00 p.m. The City of Somerset
reserves the right to reject any and all bids.

Eddie R. Girdler, Mayor
City of Somerset

== Kay & Kay Contracting, LLC
CONTRACTING CORPORATION 1354 kALY Hoas
Post O BOX 138 Congon. Y a0744 e0a
55 W LIAM ROWINGON, PRESION N1 PHOIE GOG-B64 7384
o ey e it e

15 June 2007

dune 15, 2007

Cily of Somerset
400 E. ML Vernon St City of Somarset
Somerset, Kentucky 42501 400 E. Mt. Vernon Street

Somerset, KY 42501
Attn.: Mayor Eddie R. Girdler

Attn; Mayor Eddie Girdler
We hareby submit bida on the fallowing Asphai ltems as advertised: Dear Sir:
Ci2 Asphalt Base 0.75D PG84-22 (F.0.B.) $44.00 Ton We respectfully submit the following bids for the following advertised Asphalt items:
C12 Asphelt Binder 0.500 PGB4-22 (F.0.B.) $44.00 Ton CI2 Asphalt Base 0.750 PG64-22(F.0.B.) $37.00 Ton
CI2 Asphah Surface 0.38D PG64-22 (F.0.8.) $45.00 Ton CI2 Asphalt Binder 0.50D PG64-22(F.0.8.) $38.00 Ton
CI2 Asphelt Base 0.75D PG64-22 $52.50 Ton Ci2 Asphalt Surface 0.38D PG64-22(F.0.8.) $39.00 Ten
Ci2 Asphatt Binder 0.50D PG84-22 $53.00 Ton €12 Asphalt Base 0.750 PGB4-22 $53.00 Ton
CI2 Asphall Surface 0.38D PG64-22 $53.50 Ton Ci2 Asphalt Binder 0.50D PG64-22 $54.00 Ton
Biturninous Tack $ 150 Galion Ciz Asphalt Surface 0.3B0 PG64-22 $55.00 Ton

Bituminous Tack $1.00 Galion

Pricas quotad herein are based upon curem fuel and esphalt prices. Bid Price is 8 maximum .
not to exceed price. Prica reductions may be provided basad on any decrease in fuel andior Pracing & Compacting DGA $12.50 Ton

liquid asphait prices.
- P 2 Excavation $25.00 cr

This bid may be extended annually if agreeable to both parties.
sincerely,

Respectfully submitted,
Hinkle Contracting Corporation KAY & KAY CONTRACTING, tLC

St/ =

GregFowerd
Division Manager Amos Hubbard,
Chief Engineer

A EQURL GRRORTUNITY CHBLLER MO

Mr. Burnett moved to accept the following bid from Bluegrass Uniforms for Police, Fire
and EMS. Mr. T. Rutherford seconded the motion. Upon roll call the following Council
Members voted “Aye”: Mr. New, Mr. Minton, Mr. Mitchell, Mr. Bourne, Mr. Burnett,
Mr. T. Rutherford, Mr. J. Rutherford, Ms. Stringer, Mr. Eastham and Mr. Girdler.

Invitation to Bid

The City of Somerset will be accepting sealed bids for the purchase of
uniforms for its emergency services departments (Police, Fire, and EMS).
The bid price will be in effect for one year beginning July 1, 2007, and
extending to June 30, 2008. Specifications for the bid can be picked up at the
City Hall, located at 400 East Mt. Vernon St.

The bids will be opened at 2:00pm on Friday, June 15th, in the
Council Chambers at Somerset City Hall. The City reserves the right to
accept or reject any and all bids.

Eddie R. Girdler, Mayor
David Godsey, City Clerk




Jun E( 07 02:03p Somersst Firw/EMS (608)677-5@55 p.2

Somerset Fire /| EMS

Sormerset Police Department
P. 0. Box 1017
400 E. Mt. Vernon Street  Somerset, KY 42502
Phone (606) 678-5176 Fax (606) 678-9238

Memo

e Mayor Blrdher and City Councli Members
Frem Chief James Latham QR F-

o Asst Chief's Godbey snd Norfiset

Dewm  June 24, 2007

=e  Uniform Bids Recommendstion

Accredited

C. Jeffrey Peck June 1996

Chiefof Pulice

o Mayor Girdler
Sumerset City Council Memnbrs

Chief (2. fefTrey Peek, Chief of Police y,/

June 21, 2007

| have reviewsd and compared the thres Uniform Bids wa recaived. 1t Ia my
recommendation (hat we continus to purchase our uniforms through
FROM: Bluegrasa Unlforms. Biuegress has submitted the lowest bid on moat of our
high volume uniform articies and | have basn
aatiafied with the aervice they have provided. During the few times that ) have
not basn satisfied with thelr tum-around time, they have been very respansive
to my concams. They perform ail of thelr silk scresning and embraidary in.
house. They hava aiso demonstrated the capabliity of delivering the larga
ordere we place on a quarterly basia in s Smaly menner.

DATE:

REF: Unifarm bid recommendation

The Poice Department recently advertised for bids to provide palice uniforms
and accessories for the 20072008 fiscal year. We received (wo bids, one from
Blucgrass Uniforms in Rowling Green and the second fiom Kentucky Uniforns
in Lexington,

Afler reviewing the bids, il is my recommendation that we accept the bid(s) from
Bluegrass Uniforms.

This recomnendation is based on total price suvings over all items and an
estblished history of salisfactory service and quality of praduct.

Thunk you for your consideration

Mr. J. Rutherford moved to accept bids on chemicals for the water treatment plant. Mr.
Mitchell seconded the motion. Upon roll call the following Council Members voted
“Aye”: Mr. New, Mr. Minton, Mr. Mitchell, Mr. Bourne, Mr. Burnett, Mr. T. Rutherford,
Mr. J. Rutherford, Ms. Stringer, Mr. Eastham and Mr. Girdler.

A SEALED B{D OPENING FOR THE FURCHASE OF CHEMICALS
LISTED, FOR A POTABLE WATER TREATMENT PLANT OF 10.0 MGD
CAPACITY WILL BE RECEIVED BY THE CITY OF SUMERSET WATER
SERVICE, P.0. BOX 969, 105 COLLEUE STREET, SOMERSET, KENTUCKY
42502,

SAID BID WILL BE OPENED AND REVIEWED AT THE CITY UTILITY
BUILDING AT 105 CULLEGE STREET, IN THE SECOND FLOOR CONFER.
ENCE ROOM , AT 1400 HRS. OR 2:00 PM ON JUNE 20, 2007,

SAID BID WILL BE FOR THE FISUAL YEAR OF JULY 1, 2007 THROUGH
JUNE 30, 2008

SAID BID MUST BE SUBMITTED IN A SEALED ENVELOPE EN-

{LOSED INAN
AND ADDRESSED TO THE CITY OF SOMBESET WATER SERVICE, P.0,
BOX 988, SOMERSET, KENTUCKY 42502,

LIQUID ALUMINIRY SULFATE
A TOTAL AL 203 MINIMUM OF cmn e - e
B. WATER IN SOLUBLES MAXIMUM OF-

A SHISIS RANGE 2.28%
TYPICAL 5%
GUARANTEED 33%
B. HEAVY METALS AS (PB) MAXIMUM— oo oo .028%

C. 4,000 GALLONS OR 45,000 LBS. BULK SHIPMENT, 6800-1200 HOURS
(AM) DELIVERY.

D. MATERIAL SAFETY DATA SHRETS (MSDS) SUPPLIED WITH ORDER,

E CERTIFICATE OF ANALYSIS SUPPLIED WTH EACE ORDER.

¥. CHEMICAL WILL BE BID ON TOTAL WEIGHT, NOT % PURITY, A
NINIMUM OF $3-96% MUST BE MAINTAINED.

G BID MUST BE LISTED ON THE BID PABULATION SHERT THAT
IS PROVIDED - WITH A FIRM PRICE OF ONE (1) YEAR,

H. BID MUST BE EXPRESSED AS COST PER WET TON,

CHLORINE

4
A SHALL BR IN ONE (1) TON CYLINDERS AND SHALY, MEET AWWA

B301-92.

C. WATER SOLUBLES IRON AS(FE203 ), MAXIMUM OF-- - 0.35%

D. BAUME- 35,50 36 @60F.

E MATERIAL SHOULD COMPLY WITH SPEC. /340393 AWWA.

F. 4,000 GALLONS OR 45,000 LBS. BULX SHIPMENT. 0800-1200 HOURS
(AM ) DELIVERY. .

0. MATERIAL SAFETY DATA SHEET (MSDS) SUPPLIED WITH EACH

ORDER

H. CERTIFICATE OF ANALYSIS SUPPLIED WITH EACH ORDER.

1. CREMICAL WILL BE BID ON TOTAL WEIGHT, NOT % PURITY, A
MINIMUM OF 8% MUST BE MAINTAINED.

J. BID MUST BE LISTED OM THE BID TABULATION SHEET THAT
18 PROVIDED WITH A FIRM PRICE OF ONE (1) YEAR.

K BID MUST BE EXPRESSED AS COST PER DRY TON.

LIQUID CAUSTIC BODA
STANDARD GRADE-25%
2

A SPECIFIC GRAVITY @ B0F ---<moeemermesomerre—ams e 1212.1.283
B.¥NACH. M 52B5%
C.%NA2C03. - 0.03-0.09%
D #NAZOTOTAL 19.0-19.76%
E. KNAOH (76% NAZ 0) BABIB--++—src o mecrreoe 25.0-26.0%

F. 4,000 GALLONS OR 45,000 LBS. BULK SHIPMENT. 0800-1200 HOURS
(AM ) DELIVERY,

G. MATERIAL SAFETY DATA SHEETS (MSDS) SUPPLIED WITH EACH
ORDER.

H. CERTIFICATE OF ANALTSIS SUPPLIED WITH EACH ORDER.

1. CHEMICAL WILL BE BID ON TOTAL WEIGHT, NOT % PURITY, A
MINTMUM OF 34.5%-23.56% MUST BE MAINTAINED.

J. BID MURT BE LISTED ON THE BID TABULATION SHEET THAT

X BID MUST B8 EXPRESSED AS CORT PXR WET ONE HUNDRED
WEIGHT- OR-WRECWT, -
HES
HYDROPLUQSILICIC ACID

6.

B, MUST DE DELIVERED IN OSHA APPROVED TRANSPORTATION AND
REMOVAL METHOD.

C. MUST BE EQUIPPED WITH A RYDRAULIC LOADING AND UN-
LOADING TAILGATE.

D. SUPPLY CHLORINE SAFETY TRAINING AT BIDDERS EXPENSE AT
LEAST TWO (2) PROGRAMS A YEAR ~ SPRING AND FALL.

E. FULLOW ALL STANDARD EPA RISK MANACEMENT GUIDELINES.

F. 9800-1800 HOURS (AM ) DELIVERY.

G. MATERIAL SAFETY DATA SHEETS (MSDS) SUPPLIED WITH EACH
ORDER.

H. KID MUST BE LISTER ON THE RID TABUATION SHEET THAT

18 PROVIDED - WITH A IRM PRICE QF ONE (1) YRAR,
L BID MUST BE EXPRESSED A COST PER ONE HUNDRED
WRIGHT OR CWT,

PAC

POWDNERED ACTIVATED CARBON
TH1S YEAR WE ARE REQUESTING, THATEVERY ONE PLEASE SUBMIT
THEIK BLD UN CALGON - WPH - POWDERED ACTIVATED CARBON,

A WATER IN SOLUBLES RETAINRD ON A 325 MESH SCREEN WILL BE
LESS THAN 10%.

B. MATERIAL SHALL BE IN 50 L. BAGS

C. MATERIAL SHALL MEET AWWA STANDARDS B400-78 FOR TREAT-
MENT OF POTABLE WATER.

D. FHENOL VALUE { PPM)-

£ MODLFIKD PHENUL VALUE -

F. I0DINE NUMBER MINLMUM OF. —

G.MUST BE EQUIPPED WITH A HYDRAUTIC LOADING AND UN-
LOADING TAILUGATE.

H. 0800- 1300 HOURS (AM ) DELIVERY.

1. BID MUST BE LISTED ON THE BID TABULATION SHEBT THAT
18 PROVIDED - WITH A ¥IEN PRICE OF ONE. (1 YEAR. . __...

* 4'BID MUST BE EXPRESSED AS COST PER ONE HUNDRED

WEIGHT QR CWT.
PEOSPHATE

6. REQUIREMENTS:

A PRONUCT SHALL BE COUPON TESTED FOR 96 DAYS, BEFORE SAID
BID DATE OP JULY 1, 2007 ON A COUPON RACK SUPPLIED BY SAIL
BIDDER, AND MAINTAINED BY SAID BIDDER

B.PRODUCT SHALL BE A'GRANULAR MIXTURE CONTAINING NO
METALS AND SHALL BE A MINIMUM OF §3% TOTAL PHOSPHATE
BY WEIOHT

C.PRODUCT SHALL BE A BLEND OF POTASSIUM AND SODIUN
ORTHO/PROSPHATE SALTS. THE ACTIVE INGREDIENTS WILL DE
WITHIN A RATIO OF 4:1 TO 51 POLY TO ORTHO BY WBIGHT. THE
MATERIAL SHALL BE READILY SOLUBLE [N TAP WATER - A CON-
CENTRATION OF 2 (TWO ) POUNDS PER GALLON. HUT WATER
WILLNOT BE PROVIDED FOR MAKR-UP OF THE, SOLUTION TO
BEFED,

D. THE PHOSPRATES IN THESE SPECIFICATIONS SHALL CONTAIN
NO SOLUBLE MINERALS OR ORGANIC SUBSTANCE IN QUANTL.
TIES CAPABLE OF PRODUCING A DELETERIOUS OR INJUKIOUS
EFFECT UPON THE HEALTH OF THOSE CONSUMING WATER THAT
HAS BEEN PROPERLY TRRATED WITH THE PHOSPHATE.

E.THE SUCCESSFUL BIDDER MUST MAINTAIN CORROSION RATES
EQUAL TO OR BETTER THAN OUR PRESENT PROGRAM. COLD-
ROLL MiLD STEEL COUPONS MEASURING NILS/YEAK (MFY) COR.
ROSION WILL BE USED. THR COUPONS WILL BE INSTALLED IN
BY-PASS RACKS IN THE DISTRIBUTION SYSTEM.

F.A MINIMUM OF FOUR CORROSION TFST FROM THE COUPON
RACK, WILL BE REQUIRED DURING THE YEAR, ONE EACH QUAR-
TER

G.COUPONS AND RACKS ARE TO BE FURNISHEO TO SOMERSET
WATER SERVICE AT NO COST AND WILL BECOME THE PROPERTY
OF SOMERSET WATER SERVICE.

H TECHNICAL ON-SITE ASSISTANCE WILL BE PROVIDED AT A MIN.
MUM OF ONE DAY PER MONTH DURING THE START-UP PHASE OR
ON A9 NEEDED BASIS THEREAFTER.

L. APRODUCT TECHNICAL PAGE, EPA, NSF STANDARD 60 APPROVAL,

AND MSDS 18 TO Bk PROVIDED WITH THE BID.

1. PRODUCT T0 BE BID BY COST PER MILLION GALLONS,
TREATED WITH PARTS PER MILLION FEED RATE STATED. AN
ANNUAL COST FIGURE WILL BE PROJECTED BASED ON AN AV-
ERAGE OF 10.0 GD. BOTH FIGURES OF COST WILL BE SHOWN
ON THE BID.

K BID MUST BE LISTED ON THE BID TABULATION SHEET THAT
18 PROYIDED- WITH A FIRM PRICE OF ONR (1) YEAR.

L. BID MUST BE EXPRESSED AS COST PER POUND (CPR),

NOTE: FAILURE 70 PROVIDE ANY OF THE REQUIRED DOCU.

MENTATION LISTED ABOVE WILL RESULT IN DISQUALL-
PICATION OF THE BID.
TMENT

SOMERSET WATER SERVICE BESERVES THE RIGHT TO ACCEPT OR

REJECT ANY ANDVOR ALL BIDS.

o e m e e . S(IMERSET WATER SERVICE—
TREA'TMENT PLANT
P.0 BOX 989
6400 SOUTH HWY. 27
SOMERSET, KY. 42501




Bid Results
FY2007-08 Water Treatment Chemicals

Brenntagg  Chemical  CiThomburg Pristine Univar  General  Shannon C&S  JiLindusties  Ulrich

Resources Waler Solutions Chemicll  Chemical  Chemical
Lig Alum Sufale nobid  nobid fio bid nobid  nobid §760607 nobid §29900 nobid  nobid
Per Dry Ton
Liquid Caustic Soda 25% $ no bid ne bid $850 nobid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Per Wel CWT
HFS no bid no bid nobid nobid  nobid no bid no bid no bid
Per Wet Tan
Cholorine nobhid $ 2650 no bid nobid nobid  nobid no bid no bid no bid
Per Wet Cwt
Powdered Actvaled Carbon 4G nobid o bid nobid  nobid nobid nobid  nobid  nobid  nobid
Per Cvt
Phosphate nobid  nobid no bid 8" nobid nobid $ 177 nobd § 264 nobid
Per Pound

Mr. Bourne moved to approve as presented property, general liability and workers
compensation insurance from Reed Brothers Insurance. Mr. New seconded the motion.
Upon roll call the following Council Members voted “Aye”: Mr. New, Mr. Minton, Mr.
Mitchell, Mr. Bourne, Mr. Burnett, Mr. T. Rutherford, Mr. J. Rutherford, Ms. Stringer,
Mr. Eastham and Mr. Girdler.

' v
KLG Scotisdale Travalers Trdent  KEMI
Packeage 393335 438576 200684 08503 n'a
Workers Comp. 509831 479195
2%aisc 18083 n/a n'a na na
I
Total Frem 805103 778758

“Including KEMI workers compensation

Optional Umbrella Quotes rom Travelers 1,000,000 23708
¥2,000,000 34035

3,000,000 9707

4,000,000 42542

5,000,000 44007

There being no further business the meeting adjourned.

APPROVED

MAYOR

ATTEST:

CITY CLERK



